
 SWING STRATEGY

ICT  JUSAD



Identify the Opening: Mark the
opening of the New York midnight
session, which starts at 12 AM,
indicating the beginning of the new
trading day.

1.

Mark Highs and Lows: Identify and
mark the high and low points of the
Asian session.

2.

Monitor the London Session: As the
London session begins, watch for a
sweep of liquidity from either the buy
side or the sell side.

3.

Confirm Liquidity Sweep: Once a
liquidity sweep is confirmed, wait for
a market structure shift (MSS) with
displacement, which is characterized
by a strong price movement in the
opposite direction of the liquidity
sweep.

4.
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5.Identify Entry Points: After confirming
the MSS with displacement, switch to a
3-minute or 1-minute time frame. Wait
for the price to return to an institutional
reference point, such as a Fair Value Gap
(FVG), an Order Block, or a Breaker Block.
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